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Freshers'	Welcome	Organized	by	the	Northeast	Society	of	Satyawati	College	:	

The	North-East	Society	of	Satyawati	College	organized	a	Freshers'		welcome	to	the	new	batch	of	students	with	
enthusiasm	and	warmth.		
The	 event,	 held	 on	 21st	October,	2024,	 was	 a	 vibrant	 celebration	 aimed	 at	 introducing	 them	 to	 the	 college	
culture.	
The	 program	 commenced	 with	 a	 heartfelt	 welcome	 speech	 by	 the	 members	 of	 the	 society,	 who	 extended	
greetings	to	the	freshers	and	encouraged	them	to	actively	participate	in	college	life.	This	was	followed	by	an	
address	by	the	convener	of	the	sociey,	Dr.	Renu	Sinha,	who	shared	words	of	wisdom	and	motivation.	
The	 event	 featured	 a	 variety	 of	 cultural	 performances,	 including	 traditional	 Northeast	 dance	 and	 music,	
showcasing	the	rich	heritage	of	the	region.	Students	also	participated	in	fun	activities	such	as		a	fashion	show	
and	 talent	 performances,	making	 the	 event	 entertaining	 and	 interactive.The	 highlight	 of	 the	 event	was	 the		
crowning	 of	 Mr.	 and	 Ms.	 Fresher.	 The	 winners	 were	 crowned	 amidst	 loud	 cheers	 from	 their	 peers.	 The	
celebration	concluded	with	a	vote	of	thanks	given	by	the	president	of	the	society,	expressing	gratitude	to	the	
organizers,	faculty	members	and	attendees	for	making	the	event	a	success.		
The	Freshers'	Welcome	proved	to	be	a	memorable	occasion,	fostering	new	friendships	and	making	the	shers	
fee	home	in	their	new	academic	journey.	

								 						 	

	

Help	desk	put	up	by	northeast	society	of	satyawati	college	:	

North	 East	 Society	 put	 up	 a	 help	 desk	 during	 the	Admissions	 to	 facilitate	 the	 students.	 This	 also	 helped	 in	
spreading	awareness	about	 the	Society	amongst	 the	new	batch	of	students	and	many	students	registered	to	
become	members	of	the	Society	as	they	took	admission	in	the	college.	
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Winter	Donation	Drive	by	the	Northeast	Society	of	Satyawati	College	:	

The	Northeast	Society	of	Satyawati	College	organized	a	Winter	Donation	Drive	on	27th	November,	to	support	
underprivileged	communities	during	 the	cold	season.	Students	and	 faculty	actively	participated	by	donating	
warm	clothes	and	essential	supplies.	
The	collected	 items	were	distributed	 to	 those	 in	need	at	 [mention	 location],	bringing	warmth	and	smiles	 to	
many.	The	initiative	received	overwhelming	support	and	appreciation,	highlighting	the	spirit	of	generosity	and	
community	service.	

		 				 				 	

Seminar	Lecture	Organized	by	the	Northeast	Society	of	Satyawati	College(M)	

Title:	Regional	Development	and	Socio-Economic	Challenges	in	Northeast	India	
Speaker:	Prof.	Ravi	Shekhar,	Centre	for	Study	of	Regional	Development,	Jawaharlal	Nehru	University	
Date:	13th	November,	2024	
Venue:	Seminar	room	
The	North-East	Society	of	Satyawati	College	successfully	organized	a	seminar	lecture	on	"Regional	
Development	and	Socio-Economic	Challenges	in	Northeast	India."	The	distinguished	speaker	for	the	event	was	
Prof.	Ravi	Shekhar	from	the	Centre	for	Study	of	Regional	Development,	Jawaharlal	Nehru	University	(JNU).	The	
seminar	was	attended	by	students	and	faculty	members	fostering	an	engaging	discussion	on	the	economic	
and	developmental	challenges	faced	by	Northeast	India.	The	seminar	commenced	with	a	warm	welcome	
address	by	the	members	of	the	Northeast	Society,	who	emphasized	the	importance	of	understanding	the	
unique	developmental	challenges	and	opportunities	of	the	Northeast	region.	This	was	followed	by	an	
introductory	speech	by	the	convener	of	the	society,	Dr.	Renu	Sinha	highlighting	the	signi:icance	of	the	event	
and	welcoming	our	esteemed	guest	speaker.	
Key	Highlight	of	the	Seminar	:	

Prof.	Ravi	Shekhar	began	his	 lecture	by	providing	an	overview	of	Northeast	 India's	unique	geographical	and	
socio-cultural	landscape.	He	highlighted	the	region’s	potential	in	terms	of	natural	resources,	biodiversity,	and	
human	 capital	 while	 also	 addressing	 the	 historical	 factors	 that	 have	 contributed	 to	 its	 economic	
marginalization.	 Key	 topics	 such	 as	 economic	 disparities	 and	 regional	 development¸socio	 -	 economic	
challenges	and	political	and	policies	were	discussed	in	this	interactive	session.	
The	seminar	concluded	with	a	vote	of	thanks	delivered	by	the	President	of	the	Northeast	Society.	The	session	
was	 highly	 informative	 and	 thought-	 provoking,	 leaving	 the	 attendees	 with	 a	 deeper	 understanding	 of	 the	
socio-economic	challenges	and	developmental	prospects	of	Northeast	India.	
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NESSDU	Annual	Sports	Meet	2024	–	25	

North	 East	 Society	 represented	 Satyawati	 College	 in	 the	 NESSDU(North	 East	 Students’	 Society,	 Delhi	
University)	Annual	Sports	Meet	which	was	organized		from		21.02.2025	to		24.02.2025.	The	Society	members	
played	wonderfully,	both	men’s	 team	and	women’s	 team	showcased	 their	 true	 spirit	 and	brought	pride	and	
honour	to	our	institution	by	showcasing	their	outstanding	performances	in	the	NESSDU	Sports	Meet.	

			 			 	

				 		 	

Seminar	Lecture	Organized	by	the	Northeast	Society	of	Satyawati	College	(M)	

Title:	Indigenous:	Perception,	Problems,	and	Prospects	
Speaker:	Prof.	Deepshika	Mahanta	Bortamuly	
Af#iliation:	Department	of	English,	Daulat	Ram	College,	University	of	Delhi	
Venue:	Seminar	room	
Date:	28th	February,	2025	
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The	 Northeast	 Society	 of	 Satyawati	 College	 (M)	 organized	 an	 insightful	 talk	 on	 the	 topic	 "Indigenous:	
Perception,	Problems,	and	Prospects."	The	session	was	delivered	by	Prof.	Deepshika	Mahanta	Bortamuly	from	
the	Department	of	English,	Daulat	Ram	College,	University	of	Delhi.	The	seminar	aimed	 to	shed	 light	on	 the	
historical,	social,	and	contemporary	issues	concerning	indigenous	communities	while	also	exploring	potential	
solutions	and	future	opportunities	for	their	development.Prof.	Bortamuly	initiated	the	session	by	providing	a	
comprehensive	 understanding	 of	 the	 term	 ‘Indigenous’	 and	 its	 relevance	 in	 the	 socio-political	 and	 cultural	
discourse.	 She	 emphasized	 how	 indigenous	 communities	 have	 historically	 faced	 marginalization	 and	 the	
struggle	 to	 preserve	 their	 identity	 in	 an	 increasingly	 globalized	 world.	 She	 focused	 on	 perception	 of	
indigenous	communities,	problem	faced	by	these	communities	such	as	challenges	of	political	representation	
and	policy	neglect	and	also	discussed	about	prospects	and	the	way	forward	such	as	the	impact	of	government	
policies	and	af-irmative	action	in	empowering	indigenous	groups.The	seminar	was	followed	by	an	interactive		
session,	 where	 students	 raised	 thought-provoking	 questions	 and	 Prof.	 Bortamuly	 provided	 insightful	
responses	 and	 encouraged	 students	 to	 engage	 in	 further	 research	 and	 advocacy	 for	 indigenous	 issues.The	
seminar	 proved	 to	 be	 an	 enlightening	 experience	 for	 all	 attendees,	 fostering	 a	 deeper	 understanding	 of	
indigenous	concerns.	Prof.	Deepshika	Mahanta	Bortamuly’s	 lecture	not	only	highlighted	the	challenges	faced	
by	indigenous	communities	but	also	instilled	a	sense	of	responsibility	among	students	to	contribute	to	a	more	
inclusive	 and	 equitable	 society.	 The	 Northeast	 Society	 expressed	 gratitude	 to	 the	 speaker	 for	 her	 valuable	
insights	and	to	the	organizing	team	for	making	the	event	a	success.	

		 	 				 	

Asst.	 Cultural	 Secretary	 of	 Northeast	 Society	 Satyawati	 College,	 Chingtham	 Erawati	 presented	 a	 Manipuri	
ensemble	together	with	Suprim	Boruah,	the	President	of	the	North	East	Cell	of	Ramjas	College,	at	two	different	
events;	“Octet’25”	organised	by	the	Ethnic	Eight,	Northeast	Society	of	Jesus	and	Mary	College	and	“Orion”,	the	
annual	fest	of	the	Northeast	cell	of	Lady	Shree	Ram	College	for	Women.	
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Etinpham,	 popularly	 known	 as	 e-tinfm,	 is	 a	Delhi-based	Manipuri	 indie	 band	 that	 emerged	 from	 a	 creative	
collaboration	 between	 the	 Northeast	 societies	 of	 Satyawati	 College	 and	 Zakir	 Husain	 College.	 The	 band	 is	
made	up	of	passionate	and	talented	young	musicians:	Rohit	RK,	a	second-year	BA	Programme	student	 from	
Satyawati	College	and	the	cultural	head	of	the	society,	serves	as	the	main	vocalist;	Sushan	Ch,	a	second-year	
Psychology	 Honours	 student	 from	 Zakir	 Husain	 College,	 brings	 his	 skill	 as	 the	 lead	 guitarist;	 and	 Henba	
Laitonjam,	 an	 alumnus	 of	 Satyawati	 College	 and	 former	 Cultural	 Head	 of	 its	 Northeast	 Society,	 drives	 the	
rhythm	as	the	drummer.	
Etinpham	has	been	steadily	gaining	recognition	for	their	soulful	fusion	of	Manipuri	sounds	with	indie	music,	
performing	as	guest	artists	at	various	Delhi	University	colleges.	On	27th	February	2025,	they	took	the	stage	at	
Janki	 Devi	 Memorial	 College,	 following	 up	 on	 the	 momentum	 and	 acclaim	 they	 had	 built	 from	 previous	
performances.	 Their	 growing	 reputation	 led	 to	 an	 invitation	 to	 Miranda	 House,	 where	 they	 performed	 as	
special	guests	on	29th	March	2025,	earning	enthusiastic	feedback	from	the	audience.	
Riding	the	wave	of	appreciation	and	growing	support,	Etinpham	is	now	gearing	up	for	their	next	performance	
as	special	guest	artists	at	Zakir	Husain	College	on	8th	April	2025,	continuing	their	mission	to	share	the	spirit	
of	Northeast	culture	through	music.																																			
THE	ANNUAL	FEST	OF	THE	NORTHEAST	SOCIETY,	ENAJORI	:	

Enajori	 is	 a	 vibrant	 cultural	 fest	 organized	 by	 the	 students	 of	 the	 Northeast	 Society	 of	 Satyawati	 College	
(Morning),	 University	 of	 Delhi.	 Celebrating	 the	 rich	 and	 diverse	 heritage	 of	 Northeast	 India,	 the	 event	
showcases	 traditional	 music,	 dance,	 art,	 fashion,	 and	 cuisine,	 bringing	 together	 students	 from	 across	 the	
region	and	beyond.	Enajori	serves	as	a	platform	to	promote	cultural	exchange,	unity,	and	appreciation	for	the	
Northeast’s	unique	identity	within	the	larger	academic	community.	
Mr.	Niraj	Kumar,	Joint	Secretary,	Govt.	of	India,	Ministry	of	Development	of	Northeastern	Region	was	the	Guest	
of	Honour	of	this	program.		
The	event	began	with	a	Welcome	Address,	Lighting	of	the	Lamp	by	Guest	of	honor	and	the	faculty	members	
followed	by	the	Felicitation	of	the	honorable	guest.		

We	 then	 resumed	 the	 event	 by	 speeches	 delivered	 by	 the	 Convener,	 Dr.	 Renu	 Sinha	 and	 Principal	 of	 the	
college,	Prof.	 Subhash	Kumar	Singh.	The	Yearly	Report,	 the	General	Secretary	of	 the	society	 then	presented	
highlighting	the	society’s	achievements.	Cultural	events	included	an	Opening	Song,	which	was	prepared	by	the	
members	of	the	Society,	Solo	and	Group	Dance	Competitions	in	which	students	from	different	colleges	of	Delhi	
University	 participated	 enthusiastically.	 Students	 of	 the	 society	 and	 special	 performances	 by	 students	 of	
different	 colleges	 prepared	 diverse	 performances.	The	 audience	 enjoyed	 In-House	 Tibetan	 and	 a	 Fusion	
Dance,	an	Open	Mic,	and	a	Ramp	Walk	by	members,	which	was	the	highlight	of	the	event.	The	fest	concluded	
with	the	Declaration	of	Results	and	the	winners	of	the	group	dance	competition	and	Solo	Dance	Competition	
were	 St.	 Stephen's	 College	 and	 Janaki	 Devi	 College,	 respectively.	 The	 event	 then	 ended	 with	 the	 Vote	 of	
Thanks,	and	a	Closing	Address.	Enajori’25	was	a	colorful	celebration	of	unity,	culture,	and	talent.	
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FELICITATION	CEREMONY	:	The	Northeast	Society	of	Satyawati	College	(M)	organized	a	heartfelt	Felicitation	
Ceremony	to	honor	the	outgoing	office	bearers	and	bid	farewell	to	the	graduating	seniors.	

The	event	began	with	a	warm	Welcome	Address,	setting	the	tone	of	gratitude	and	memories	 for	a	day.	This	
was	 followed	 by	 the	 Felicitation	 of	 the	 Executives	 for	 their	 unwavering	 service,	 and	 the	 Felicitation	 of	 the	
seniors,	acknowledging	their	contributions	to	the	society.	

An	Opening	Song,	performed	as	a	farewell	token,	added	an	emotional	touch	to	the	occasion.	Fun	Games	were	
conducted	to	engage	everyone	and	lift	the	spirits.	Melodious	Songs	were	also	presented	by	the	members	of	the	
society,	which	were	enjoyed	by	all.	

A	 lively	 Questioning	 Round	 for	 the	 seniors	 brought	 out	 laughter	 and	 nostalgia,	 which	 concluded	 with	 the	
Declaration	of	Mr.	 and	Miss	Farewell	based	on	 their	 responses.	The	event	 ended	on	a	heartfelt	note	with	a	
Farewell	Speech	and	Closing	Remarks	given	by	the	Convener	of	the	society,	Dr.	Renu	Sinha.	
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